ERICKA ANDREW, BUYER
andrewe@jccal.org
TABULATION SHEET
BID# 105-18 ASPHALT ( PLANT MIX)

UNIT | JEFFERSON JEFFERSON  |SHELBY COUNTY | SHELBY COUNTY -| TuscALoOsA | TuscALoosA BIBB COUNTY CWIEION CHILTON WINSTON WALKER (SR ELLOUL SREIR | o guam || EEENENTH FICIKENS
ITEM # ’;(L)%?(T:ggg DESCRIPTION PRICE BY | SO0 MIP| county-punn [ mip souTk DUNN COUNTY -MID | COUNTY-DuNN [ B183 COUNTH - HID DUNN CO i P| county - bunn | counTY - MID Dm‘:sg c())r\’rs.‘r l\il?alégL:'H C(D)LJEJY S%%ZLK_H DL?’\‘L’\? ooNeT ’\if)D"égL:_H DUNN ’\%OD"égL:_H C%"[’J';‘\‘LY I
TON PAVING CONSTRUCTION PAVING CONSTRUCTION SOUTH PAVING CONSTRUCTION CONSTRUCTION PAVING CONST. SOUTH PAVING : PAVING CONST PAVING : PAVING CONST. PAVING CONST
1 327A020  |PLANT MIX, SLAG SEAL (Hot Mix) TON $59.00 $41.33 $59.00 NO BID $70.00 NO BID $70.00 NO BID $70.00 NO BID $68.00 NO BID $59.00 | NOBID $59.00 NO BID $59.00 NOBID | $70.00 |NOBID
2 327E000  |BLACK BASE TON $53.00 $37.81 $53.00 NO BID $65.00 NO BID $65.00 NO BID $65.00 NO BID $61.00 NO BID $53.00 | NOBID $53.00 NO BID $53.00 NOBID | $65.00 |NOBID
3 4308 019 (“‘\AL/’;\::‘E'Z]FWBLASTF“RNACESLAG TON NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID |[NOBID
4 430B 006 |NUMBER 89 STONE TON NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID |NOBID
5 202 A000 __|SLURRY DEAL COAT TYPE L& TYPEZ | TON NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID_| NOBID | _NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID_| _NOBID_|NO BID
[JOINT SEALANT - CRAFCO PAVEMENT
6 w7000 [T o TON NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID |NOBID
7 327A020  [PLANT MIX BITUMINOUS BASE MIX TON $53.00 $37.81 $53.00 NO BID $65.00 NO BID $65.00 NO BID $65.00 NO BID $61.00 NO BID $53.00 | NOBID $53.00 NO BID $53.00 NOBID | $65.00 |NOBID
POLYMER MODIFIED OPEN PATB
8 aomots [ O e TON NO BID $61.16 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID |NOBID
9 aap  [SEERPAVESTELEVEL WEARING TON NO BID $46.51 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID |NOBID
10 aap  [SEERPAVE N ELEVEL WEARING TON NO BID $44.69 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID |NOBID
1 424 A336 \S/y;fgmggj@ :C’i LEVEL BASE & TON $64.00 $42.02 $64.00 NO BID $73.00 NO BID $73.00 NO BID $73.00 NO BID $70.00 NO BID $64.00 | NOBID $64.00 NO BID $64.00 NO BID $73.00 |NOBID
12 upsp  [SUPERPAVEY AVS LEVEL BASE & TON $59.00 $41.33 $59.00 NO BID $70.00 NO BID $70.00 NO BID $70.00 NO BID $68.00 NO BID $50.00 | NOBID $59.00 NO BID $59.00 NOBID | $7000 |NOBID
13 aansar  [PERPAVE S AB LEVEL BASE & TON $57.00 $40.32 $57.00 NO BID $69.00 NO BID $69.00 NO BID $69.00 NO BID $65.00 NO BID $57.00 | NOBID $57.00 NO BID $57.00 NOBID | $69.00 |NOBID
14 unzse  [SUPERPAVE IS D LEVEL BASE & TON $64.00 $42.02 $64.00 NO BID $73.00 NO BID $73.00 NO BID $73.00 NO BID $70.00 NO BID $64.00 | NOBID $64.00 NO BID $64.00 NOBID | $73.00 |NOBID
15 wupsgo  [oSRPAVEY OD LEVELBASE& TON $59.00 $41.33 $59.00 NO BID $70.00 NO BID $70.00 NO BID $70.00 NO BID $68.00 NO BID $50.00 | NOBID $59.00 NO BID $59.00 NOBID | $7000 |NOBID
16 aaA33 |0 TON $57.00 $40.32 $57.00 NO BID $69.00 NO BID $69.00 NO BID $69.00 NO BID $65.00 NO BID $57.00 | NOBID [ $57.00 NO BID $57.00 NOBID [ $69.00 [NOBID
GRAND TOTAL PER REGION/COUNTY|  $525.00 $516.65 $525.00 $0.00 $624.00 $0.00 $624.00 $0.00|  $624.00 $0.00 $596.00 $0.00|  $525.00 $0.00 $525.00 $0.00 $525.00 $0.00|  $624.00]  $0.00
STATE PLANT LOCATIONS & DELIVERY HOURS MIDSOUTH PAVING INC. DUNN CONSTRUCTION CO.
1. STATE PLANT LOCATION(S) WHERE THE REQUIRED MATERIAL(S) WILL BE AVAILABLE - JEFFERSON COUNTY TARRANT/EAST THOMAS - 48 HOURS TARRANT/EAST THOMAS/LAKESHORE
2. STATE PLANT LOCATION(S) WHERE THE REQUIRED MATERIAL(S) WILL BE AVAILABLE - SHELBY COUNTY EAST THOMAS - 48 HOURS NO BID
3. STATE PLANT LOCATION(S) WHERE THE REQUIRED MATERIAL(S) WILL BE AVAILABLE - TUSCALOOSA COUNTY VAUCE - 48 HOURS NO BID
4. STATE PLANT LOCATION(S) WHERE THE REQUIRED MATERIAL(S) WILL BE AVAILABLE - BIBB COUNTY VAUCE - 48 HOURS NO BID
5. STATE PLANT LOCATION(S) WHERE THE REQUIRED MATERIAL(S) WILL BE AVAILABLE - CHILTON COUNTY VAUCE - 48 HOURS NO BID
6. STATE PLANT LOCATION(S) WHERE THE REQUIRED MATERIAL(S) WILL BE AVAILABLE - WINSTON COUNTY TUSCUMBIA - 48 HOURS NO BID
7. STATE PLANT LOCATION(S) WHERE THE REQUIRED MATERIAL(S) WILL BE AVAILABLE - WALKER COUNTY EAST THOMAS - 48 HOURS NO BID
8. STATE PLANT LOCATION(S) WHERE THE REQUIRED MATERIAL(S) WILL BE AVAILABLE - BLOUNT COUNTY TARRANT - 48 HOURS NO BID
9. STATE PLANT LOCATION(S) WHERE THE REQUIRED MATERIAL(S) WILL BE AVAILABLE - ST. CLAIR COUNTY TARRANT - 48 HOURS NO BID
10. STATE PLANT LOCATION(S) WHERE THE REQUIRED MATERIAL(S) WILL BE AVAILABLE - PICKENS COUNTY VAUCE - 48 HOURS NO BID
REQUIRED DOCUMENTS MIDSOUTH PAVING INC. DUNN CONSTRUCTION CO.
Notification of Intent to Respond YES YES
Non-Collusion Affidavit YES YES
EEOC Form YES YES
Affidavit of Contractor YES YES
Signature Page YES YES
Price (BID) Sheet YES YES
PACA Required Forms YES YES
Addendum 1 YES YES

CONTACT INFORMATION

MIDSOUTH PAVING INC.

|PAOA BOX 385025 BIRMINGHAM, AL 35238 | BRET THORNTON P:205 - 995 -5900 E: BRET. THORNTON@MIDSOUTHPAVING.COM

DUNN CONSTRUCTION CO., INC. | 3905 Messer Airport Highway Birmingam , AL 35222 | EVANS DUNN P: 205 - 592 - 3866 F: 205- 599-1717 OR 205-592-4632 E: EDUNN@DUNNCONSTRUCTION.COM




